| Angular Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | | | | | |
|---|--------------------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------------------------|----------------------------|--|
| Bids Due: 2/28/2024 | Summary | | | | |
| Bid Item #4 - Corrugated Galvanized Steel Pipe Culverts | | | | | |
| 1. Galvanized Steel Culverts (Lineal Foot) | Bid Item #4 - Corrugated Galva | | | | |
| Round Pipe Cadillac Culvert St. Regis Culvert Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. Milan Supply | Bia item #4 Gorragatea Garve | dinzed oteer i ipe outverte | | | |
| 12" Diameter, 16 gauge | 1. Galvanized Steel Culverts (| Lineal Foot) | | | |
| 15" Diameter, 16 gauge \$10.40 \$11.40 \$10.39 \$14.59 \$12.65 \$12.65 \$12.65 \$12.65 \$12.65 \$17.55 \$12.69 \$17.55 \$18.05 \$16.65 \$18.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$27 Diameter, 16 gauge \$16.65 \$18.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$27 Diameter, 14 gauge \$26.70 \$28.50 \$26.84 \$37.04 \$27 Diameter, 12 gauge \$26.70 \$28.50 \$26.84 \$37.04 \$28 Diameter, 12 gauge \$27 Diameter, 12 gauge \$27 Diameter, 12 gauge \$27 Diameter, 12 gauge \$113.63 \$16 gauge \$25.25 \$103.67 \$212.63 \$27 Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 \$14.26 Diameter, 10 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 Diameter, 10 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 Diameter, 10 gauge \$16.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 Diameter, 10 gauge \$16.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 Diameter, 10 gauge \$16.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 Diameter, 10 gauge \$46.70 \$57.25 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 337.20 \$50.25 \$27.75 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 337.20 \$50.25 \$27.75 | Round Pipe | <u>Cadillac Culvert</u> | St. Regis Culvert | Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. | Milan Supply |
| 15" Diameter, 16 gauge \$10.40 \$11.40 \$10.39 \$14.59 \$14.59 \$17.55 \$18**Diameter, 16 gauge \$12.65 \$14.25 \$12.69 \$17.55 \$18**Diameter, 16 gauge \$16.65 \$18.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 \$15.00 \$16.05 \$16.70 \$ | 12" Diameter 16 gauge | \$8.38 | \$9.50 | \$8.37 | \$11.83 |
| 18" Diameter, 16 gauge \$12.65 \$14.25 \$12.69 \$17.55 24" Diameter, 16 gauge \$16.65 \$18.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 30" Diameter, 14 gauge \$26.70 \$28.50 \$26.84 \$37.04 36" Diameter, 14 gauge \$32.25 \$34.20 \$32.34 \$44.49 48" Diameter, 12 gauge \$58.40 \$61.75 \$58.74 \$81.62 60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 16 gauge - \$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 14 gauge - \$76.95 \$127.47 \$167.07 Arch Pipe 17" x 13", 14 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 21" x 15", 14 gauge \$15.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 28" x 20", 14 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 52" x 20", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 5" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$66.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 7" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 | | · | · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | | |
| 24" Diameter, 16 gauge \$16.65 \$18.05 \$16.71 \$23.22 30" Diameter, 14 gauge \$26.70 \$28.50 \$26.84 \$37.04 36" Diameter, 14 gauge \$32.25 \$34.20 \$32.34 \$44.49 \$48" Diameter, 12 gauge \$58.40 \$61.75 \$58.74 \$81.62 60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 \$16 gauge \$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 \$14 gauge \$576.95 \$127.47 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$167.07 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.10 gauge \$15.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 \$157.70 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$177.40 \$167.00 \$147.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$17.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$19.24 \$117.40 \$117.4 | | * | * | | |
| 30" Diameter, 14 gauge \$26.70 \$28.50 \$26.84 \$37.04 48" Diameter, 12 gauge \$58.40 \$61.75 \$58.74 \$81.62 60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 \$16 gauge \$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 \$14 gauge \$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 \$14 gauge \$576.95 \$127.47 \$167.07 Arch Pipe \$17" x 13", 14 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$17" x 15", 14 gauge \$12.99 \$15.75 \$18.85 \$177.18 \$22.99 28" x 20", 14 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 \$161.69 57" x 38", 12 gauge \$44.60 \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 57" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 \$71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 2. Bands (Each) \$2.90 ft price \$2.00 ft price \$2 | | | | | |
| \$6" Diameter, 14 gauge \$32.25 \$34.20 \$32.34 \$44.49 \$48" Diameter, 12 gauge \$58.40 \$61.75 \$58.74 \$81.62 \$60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 \$16 gauge \$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 \$72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 \$14 gauge \$76.95 \$127.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$142.63 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$12.47 \$167.07 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$12.47 \$15.71 \$15. | | - | | | · |
| 48" Diameter, 12 gauge \$58.40 \$61.75 \$58.74 \$81.62 \$60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 \$16 gauge •\$52.25 \$103.67 \$142.63 \$12.90 \$136.36 \$14 gauge •\$76.95 \$127.47 \$167.07 \$167.07 \$12" Nameter, 10 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$19.24 \$12" Nameter, 12 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$19.24 \$12" Nameter, 12 gauge \$15.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 \$28" X 20", 14 gauge \$20.75 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 \$35" X 24", 12 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 \$26.25 \$26.80 \$30.67 \$35" X 24", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$50.169 \$7" X 38", 12 gauge \$43.00 \$68.00 \$51.69 \$35" X 77" Nameter, 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 \$189.X | | • | | | |
| 60" Diameter, 10 gauge \$113.63 | | | | | |
| 72" Diameter, 10 gauge \$136.36 | 60" Diameter 10 gauge | | • | · | |
| 17" x 13", 14 gauge \$12.99 \$15.70 \$14.44 \$19.24 \$19.24 \$12.99 \$15.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 \$28" x 20", 14 gauge \$20.75 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 \$25" x 24", 12 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 \$42" x 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 \$57" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 \$71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 \$3" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 \$No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 \$12.80 \$ | | | | | |
| 21" x 15", 14 gauge \$15.75 \$18.85 \$17.18 \$22.99 \$28" x 20", 14 gauge \$20.75 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 \$30.67 \$35" x 24", 12 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 \$42" x 29", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 \$7" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 \$83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 \$128.85 \$149.74 \$133.84 \$189.08 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. \$2 x per ft price \$2 x per ft price \$2 x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$1.65 x per ft price \$23.65 x per ft pri | Arch Pipe | | | | |
| 28" x 20", 14 gauge \$20.75 \$25.25 \$22.68 \$30.67 \$35" x 24", 12 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 \$42" x 29", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 \$57" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.65 \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 \$3" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 \$129.00 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$32.65, \$29.50 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$35.50, \$29.50 \$1.65x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$1.65x per ft price \$25.65, \$29.50 \$1 | 17" x 13", 14 gauge | \$12.99 | ¥ | \$14.44 | ¥ . • |
| 35" x 24", 12 gauge \$40.60 \$43.00 \$37.20 \$50.25 42" x 29", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 \$57" x 38", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 \$71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 \$189.08 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 \$12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 \$1.65x per ft pri | | | | | |
| 42" x 29", 12 gauge \$48.70 \$51.25 \$46.22 \$61.69 57" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 2. Bands (Each) Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | | | | | |
| 57" x 38", 12 gauge \$61.30 \$68.00 \$61.68 \$82.62 71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 Dimpled Bands (Each) Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | | | | | |
| 71" x 47", 10 gauge \$119.40 \$113.30 \$108.85 \$149.74 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 2. Bands (Each) Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 2x per ft price 3x 35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 per ft price 3x 365, \$29.50 | | | | | |
| 83" x 57", 10 gauge \$143.20 No bid \$133.84 \$189.08 2. Bands (Each) Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 335.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 | | | | | |
| 2. Bands (Each) Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | | | \$113.30 | | |
| Dimpled Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | 83" x 57", 10 gauge | \$143.20 | No bid | \$133.84 | \$189.08 |
| 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 323.65, \$29.50 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 335.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 32.65, \$29.50 | 2. Bands (Each) | | | | |
| 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103 Angular Bands (Each) Angular Bands (Each) 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | Dimpled Bands (Each) | | | | |
| Angular Bands (Each) 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | | | | | \$23.65, \$29.50 |
| 12" Wide, 12" to 15" Dia. 1.65x per ft price 1.65x per ft price \$23.65, \$29.50 | 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. | 2x per ft price | 2x per ft price | 2x per ft price | \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103.65 |
| | Angular Bands (Each) | | | | |
| 24" Wide 18" to 48" Dia 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price 2x per ft price \$25.11.546.44.574.00.588.08.5103 | | 1.65x per ft price | 1.65x per ft price | 1.60x per ft price | \$23.65, \$29.50 |
| 2x poi it prior 2x poi it prior 2x poi it prior 455.11, \$40.44, \$14.05, \$00.50, \$105 | 24" Wide, 18" to 48" Dia. | 2x per ft price | 2x per ft price | 2x per ft price | \$35.11, \$46.44, \$74.09, \$88.98, \$103.65 |

| Summary | | | | |
|---------------------------------|-------------------------------|---------------------------------|----------------------------|------------------------------|
| <u></u> | | | | |
| Bid Item #4 - Corrugated Galva | | Due: 2/28/2024 | | |
| | | | | |
| 3. Re-rolled Spiral - Pipe End, | 12" (Each) | | | |
| 12" to 24" Diameter | No charge | No charge | 1.65x per ft price | No bid |
| 24" to 72" Diameter | No charge | No charge | 1.65x per ft price | No bid |
| | | | | |
| WD ddw - Low Did | | | | |
| "Bold" = Low Bid | | | | |
| | Cadillac Culvert | St. Regis Culvert | Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. | Milan Supply |
| 4. End Sections (Each) | | | | |
| End Section - Round Pipe (Each) | | | | |
| 15" Diameter, 16 gauge | \$70.00 | \$105.00 | \$63.00 | \$80.46 |
| 18" Diameter, 16 gauge | \$80.00 | \$140.00 | \$73.00 | \$104.86 |
| 24" Diameter, 16 gauge | \$140.00 | \$175.00 | \$118.00 | \$160.10 |
| End Section - Arch Pipe (Each) | | | | |
| 21" x 15", 16 gauge | \$85.00 | \$145.00 | \$80.00 | \$104.86 |
| 28" x 20", 16 gauge | \$145.00 | \$208.00 | \$125.00 | \$160.10 |
| 35" x 24", 14 gauge | \$235.00 | \$400.00 | \$330.00 | \$366.52 |
| 42" x 29", 14 gauge | \$465.00 | \$600.00 | \$418.00 | \$525.67 |
| Discounts: | 1% 10 | 1% 10 | 1% 10 | |
| Terms of Sale: | Net 30 | Net 30 | Net 30 | Minimum order \$3000, Net 30 |
| Shipping Charges: | Less then truckload - freight | Minimum load to include freight | | |
| | charges may apply | \$6,500.00 | | |
| | | | | |
| Firm Price: | 90 days | 60 days | 60 days | 4/1/2024-3/31/2025 |

| Summary | | | |
|--|--|--------------------------------------|----------------------------------|
| | | | |
| Bid Item #4 - Corrugated Galv | anized Steel Pipe Culverts | | |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| Type of Pipe: | Corrugated Galvanized Steel Pipe Corrugated Galvanized Steel Pipe | Corrugated Galvanized Steel Pipe | Corrugated Galvanized Steel Pipe |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| "Bold" = Low Bid | | | |
| | | | |
| Miscellaneous: | | | |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| | | | |
| The 2024 Corrugated Calvanized S | Steel Pipe Culvert materials were awarded to Cadillac Culvert, Jensen Brid | dge & Supply Co. and St. Begis Culve | rt during the |
| | | | |
| Manistee County Board of County Road Commissioners regularly scheduled Board Meeting on March 13, 2024 but the MCRC will place orders based on the bids, quantities needed, and shipping charges (if any), and what is in the best interest of the MCRC. | | | |
| | , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , | | |
| | | | |
| Summary By: SKI | Date: 2/29/2024 | | |
| Checked By: JAP | Date: 3/1/2024 | | |
| | | | |
| C:\Users\Uese\Desktop\WCRC\Bids\FY 2024\Annua\Tabulations\Final\[3-13-24 \ Cold Patch Pavt Patching Bids xisx\]tem 3 Corr Alum Pipe | | | |